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FULL FACE MASSAGE

Feel the results of using Lancôme 
Advanced Génifique youth activating 
serum for 10 days in one treatment, 
strengthen skin barrier, layer by 
layer, and restore healthy, younger-
looking skin. The #1 anti-aging serum 
from Lancôme is clinically proven to 
activate 7 skin parameters.

EYE MASSAGE

With 3 million ultrasonic vibration 
technology to reduce the effects 
of stress on the eyes, get bigger, 
brighter younger looking eyes. The 
eyes become more relaxed, stronger 
eye contours, and the eye area is 
brighter & hydrated.

ALLOW IDR

LANCÔME  SERVICE

RADIANCE PRO BOOSTER



1.000++45++Enjoy the French luxury premium 
service with Lancôme Absolue 
products for healthier and younger 
longer looking skin with a golden glow. 
The exclusive ingredient of Millions of 
Perpetual Rose Molecular Fractions 
TM which is proven to work actively on 
facial cell's key molecule AMPK, which 
is considered among scientists as 
"the longevity switch" it regenerates 
skin cells, giving more hydration and 
plumpness to the face so that the skin 
feels healthier and firmer.

ALLOW IDRABSOLUE SERVICE

All prices are shown in thousands of Indonesian Rupiah and subject to 21% service charge and government tax.








